
     

  Abbeywood First School              Year 4 Summer Term Curriculum Map  

 

 English 

Writing: Diary entries, Critical analysis of a 
narrative poem, stories from other cultures, News 
Reports and explanatory texts.  

                Reading: Young, Gifted and Black and                                     
Wind in the Willows 

Science 

Electricity, Sound and Strong start (comparative 
test and recording findings) 

Key vocabulary: circuit, battery, conductor, 
insulator, switch, vibration, pitch, volume, echo, 
frequency 

 
History 

Viking and Anglo-Saxon struggle for the UK, 
Ancient Egypt. 

Key vocabulary: Longship, settlement, raid, 
Danelaw, Kingdom, rune, Pharoah, pyramid, 
hieroglyphs, mummification, Nile 

 

Geography 

The Water Cycle 

Key vocabulary: evaporation, condensation, 
precipitation, collection, water vapour, clouds, 
sun, runoff 

 

 

Computing 

Photo editing & programming  

Key Vocabulary: crop, filter, resolution, layer, 
algorithm, debugging, variable, loop 

 

RE 

How and why do people mark the significant 
events in life? 

How and why do people try to make the world a 
better place? 

 

PSHE 

Keeping safe and managing risk (playing safe) and 
mental health and emotional well-being (strength 
and challenges) 

Key vocabulary: risk, stranger, rules, emergency, 
resilience, confidence, perseverance, support. 

 

PE 

Tennis, OAA, Athletics 

Key vocabulary: serve, rally, forehand, backhand, 
volley, match point, sprint, relay long jump, 
throwing, endurance 

 

Art 

Creating props for end of                          
year production  

Creative response 

 

 

DT 

Electrical systems 

Food & Nutrition  

Music 

Composition 

Leaver’s production 

 

MFL 

The natural world 

Celebrations 

 

Maths 

Decimal, Money, Time, Shape, Statistics and 
Position and Direction 

Key Vocabulary: place value, decimal point, 
whole number, change, hour, minute, clockwise, 
polygon, symmetry, chart, coordinates, graph  

 


